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Corrigendum- Selection of an agency for conducting Capacity Development Program for
Incubators

RFP Reference Query/Suggestion Reply by Invest India

5.2, Point c: Program
Structure, Page 58

2 cohorts will be run
parallelly with 30 participant
incubators (mix of both
categories) in each
cohort

1 cohort will be run with 30
participant incubators
focusing on both new
entrants and early stage
incubators. The budget for
the program cannot exceed
INR 60 lakhs.

2.29 Point 16: Proposal
submission date

Not later than the following
date and time
Date: 2nd September 2019
Before 4 pm

Not later than 8th November
2019, Before 4 pm

2.29 (18) (ii) Manpower,
Skill set & Team
Composition "Trainers"

Is it mandatory that the
trainers should be
permanent employees? Can
the profiles of trainers who
are contractual or
empanelled with the agency
be shown under this?

Project lead should be
permanent employees of the
firm for at least one year

Trainers and project
associates can be
permanent employees or
3rd party personnel

2.29.18 Past Experience in
work of similar nature

Project Lead: Should have
relevant professional
qualification such as
master’s in business,
Commerce or Engineering
and must have minimum of
7 years’ experience with
increasing levels of
responsibility

Should have relevant
professional qualification
such as master’s in
business, Commerce or
Engineering and must have
minimum of 5 years’
experience with increasing
levels of responsibility

6.2.17 (ii) Payment Terms The financial quotation for
program cannot exceed INR
1.2 crores including the
taxes and
management fees

The financial quotation for
program cannot exceed INR
60 lakhs including the taxes
and
management fees


